
BULK MATERIAL BID PRICING

BID #17-008

DELIVERY 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019

1 Dark Bark Mulch $20.80 $20.80 $20.80 $20.00 $20.60 $21.20

2 Pulverized Dirt $28.00 $28.85 $29.70 $38.33 $41.67 $45.00

3 Non-Pulverized Dirt $22.00 $22.65 $23.35 $31.67 $35.00 $38.33

4

CALCINED CLAY (bulk) (regular) 

duraplay, turface of approved 

equal $239.00 $239.00 $239.00 $295.00 $295.00 $295.00 $255.00 $265.00 $280.00

5

CALCINED CLAY 50 lb. bags 

(regular) duraplay, turface or 

approved equal $7.25 $7.25 $7.25 $6.90 $6.90 $6.90

6

Diamond Dry 40 lb. bags 100% corn 

cob flour, beeswing & grit 

extracted, non-toxic $8.75 $9.00 $9.10

7

Sparkle/Safeline non-toxic/non-

caustic white marking lime 50 lb. 

bags $3.95 $3.95 $3.95 $4.26 $4.26 $4.26 $5.25 $5.25 $5.50

8

Infield Clay Sand Mix Bulk (70-75% 

reddusg ckat.25-30% blend sand, 

"No stone" $46.00 $46.00 $46.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $40.00 $40.50 $41.00

9

Athletic Field Marking Paint (5 Gal. 

Pails, white latex concentrate; 1 to 

1 dilution with water-non-

toxic/non-caustic) $39.00 $39.00 $39.00 $36.00 $36.00 $37.25 $37.50 $37.50 $37.50

10 Grass Seed (50 lb. bags) $82.00 $82.00 $82.00 $87.00 $87.00 $87.00 $121.00 $130.00 $135.00

11

Wood play surface must be ADA 

certified $15.90 $15.90 $15.90 $15.85 $16.35 $16.80

12 Crushed Aggregate, CA-7 Gradation $26.25 no bid no bid $25.00 $28.00 $31.00

13 Stone Riprap, Class A3 $43.00 $44.00 $45.00

PICK UP 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019 2017 2018 2019

1 Dark Bark Mulch $20.80 $20.80 $20.80 $17.00 $17.50 $18.00

2 Pulverized Dirt $18.00 $18.50 $19.00

3 Non-Pulverized Dirt $12.00 $12.50 $13.00

4

CALCINED CLAY (bulk) (regular) 

duraplay, turface of approved 

equal $350.00 $350.00 $350.00

5

CALCINED CLAY 50 lb.s bags 

(regular) duraplay, turface or 

approved equal $7.15 $7.15 $7.15 $6.80 $6.80 $6.80

6

Diamond Dry 40 lb. bags 100% corn 

cob flour, beeswing & grit 

extracted, non-toxic $8.65 $8.90 $9.00

NATIONAL SEED HOMER INDUSTRIES RAINBOW FARM ENTERPRISES SHERWIN WILLIAMS CONSERV FS SPORTSFIELDS, INC.

Delivery only

$7.75/40# bag

$7.75/40# bag
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7

Sparkle/Safeline non-toxic/non-

caustic white marking lime 50 lb. 

bags $3.85 $3.85 $3.85 $4.26 $4.26 $4.26 $5.00 $5.00 $5.25

8

Infield Clay Sand Mix Bulk (70-75% 

reddusg ckat.25-30% blend sand, 

"No stone" $55.00 $55.00 $60.00

9

Athletic Field Marking Paint (5 Gal. 

Pails, white latex concentrate; 1 to 

1 dilution with water-non-

toxic/non-caustic) $38.00 $38.00 $38.00 $36.00 $36.00 $37.25 $37.50 $37.50 $37.50

10 Grass Seed (50 lb. bags) $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $87.00 $87.00 $87.00 $121.00 $121.00 $125.00

11

Wood play surface must be ADA 

certified $15.90 $15.90 $15.90 $13.00 $13.50 $14.00

12 Crushed Aggregate, CA-7 Gradation $30.00 no bid no bid

13 Stone Riprap, Class A3

Delivery only
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