2009 Recreation Brochure RFP Results

Option 1 - spot color
50# paper w/color

Option 2 - full color

Option 3 - full color

Option 4 - spot color
35# paper w/ color

Company center spread 50# paper 35# paper center spread

Year 1

Hagg Press $18,511.24 $22,243.00 no bid no bid
DesPlaines Printing $18,883.00 $21,168.00 $19,168.00 $16,883.00
Minute Men Press $37,643.00 $50,308.00 no bid no bid
Year 2

Hagg Press $19,436.60 $23,355.00 no bid no bid
DesPlaines Printing $19,262.00 $21,592.00 $19,552.00 $17,222.00
Minute Men Press $38,395.00 $51,315.00 no bid no bid
Year 3

Hagg Press $20,407.80 $24,523.00 no bid no bid
DesPlaines Printing $19,648.00 $22,024.00 $19,944.00 $17,567.00
Minute Men Press $39,163.00 $52,341.00 no bid no bid
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