
VILLAGE OF RICHTON PARK 
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

4455 Sauk Trail, Richton Park IL 60471

Concrete Flatwork

BID #: 2021

            BID TABULATION Bid Opening: March 31, 2021 @ 10am

ITEM 

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT 
CONTRACT

QTY
UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL COST UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL COST UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

1 ARROW BOARD CAL DAY 0 no bid $250.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00 no bid

2 P.C.C. PAVEMENT PATCH CL B (7”) SY 0 no bid $72.00 $0.00 $90.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00 no bid

3 P.C.C. PAVEMENT PATCH CL C (9”) SY 0 no bid $80.00 $0.00 $120.00 $0.00 $225.00 $0.00 no bid

4 P.C.C. PAVEMENT PATCH CL B (10”) SY 0 no bid $95.00 $0.00 $140.00 $0.00 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

5

P.C.C. DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT 

(6”)
SY

250 $72.00 $18,000.00 $65.00 $16,250.00 $72.00 $18,000.00 $71.00 $17,750.00 $110.00 27500

6

P.C.C. DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT 

(8”)
SY

862 $75.00 $64,650.00 $70.00 $60,340.00 $76.50 $65,943.00 $74.00 $63,788.00 $115.00 99130

7 P.C.C. SIDEWALK REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT (5”) SF 37,905 $7.50 $284,287.50 $8.00 $303,240.00 $7.80 $295,659.00 $8.20 $310,821.00 $9.95 377154.75

8 P.C.C. SIDEWALK REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT (8”) SF 1,300 $9.50 $12,350.00 $8.50 $11,050.00 $8.75 $11,375.00 $8.40 $10,920.00 $12.00 15600

9

COMBINATION CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER REMOVAL AND 

REPLACEMENT (Variable types)
FOOT

1,370 $29.00 $39,730.00 $25.00 $34,250.00 $29.00 $39,730.00 $27.00 $36,990.00 no bid

10

COMBINATION CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER REMOVAL AND 

REPLACEMENT (B6.24)
FOOT

0 no bid $42.00 $0.00 $40.00 $0.00 $55.00 $0.00 $59.00 0

11 DETECTABLE WARNING FIELDS - ADA Solutions, cast in place SF 180 $24.00 $4,320.00 $35.00 $6,300.00 $18.00 $3,240.00 $15.00 $2,700.00 no bid

12

DETECTABLE WARNING FIELDS - "Armor Tile" cast in place 

replaceable 
SF

0 no bid $35.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $25.00 $0.00 no bid

13 DETECTABLE WARNING FIELDS - Duralast SF 0 no bid $38.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $40.00 $0.00 no bid

14 DETECTABLE WARNING FIELDS - Tiftile Cast Iron SF 0 no bid $42.00 $0.00 $40.00 $0.00 $45.00 $0.00 no bid

15

REINFORCEMENT BARS, EPOXY COATED – TWO CONTINUOUS  

NO. 5
FOOT

0 no bid $2.00 $0.00 $5.00 $0.00 $5.00 $0.00 no bid

16 AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, TYPE B, 4-INCH SY 737 $6.00 $4,422.00 $4.00 $2,948.00 $3.50 $2,579.50 $7.00 $5,159.00 $5.00 3685

17 REMOVE AND REPLACE BRICK PAVERS SF 0 no bid $15.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $50.00 $0.00 no bid

18 VV, MH, INLET, CB TO BE ADJUSTED EACH 1 $400.00 $400.00 $450.00 $450.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $495.00 495

19 HIGH-EARLY-STRENGTH PCC ADJUSTMENT (PP-2 MIX) CY 0 no bid $200.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $50.00 $0.00 no bid

20

P.C.C. COMBINATION (MONOLITHIC) SIDEWALK/CURB REMOVAL 

& REPLACEMENT 5"-6.25"
SY

0 no bid $78.00 $0.00 $90.00 $0.00 $85.00 $0.00 no bid

21 HOT-MIX ASPHALT DRIVEWAY REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT SY 60 $60.00 $3,600.00 $45.00 $2,700.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $45.00 $2,700.00 no bid

22

HOT-MIX ASPHALT STREET PAVEMENT REMOVAL AND 

REPLACEMENT 
SY

120 $56.00 $6,720.00 $55.00 $6,600.00 $67.00 $8,040.00 $60.00 $7,200.00 no bid

23 EARTH EXCAVATION CY 166 $55.00 $9,130.00 $27.00 $4,482.00 $40.00 $6,640.00 $50.00 $8,300.00 no bid

BIDDERS PROPOSAL (AS CORRECTED) $447,609.50 $448,610.00 $454,906.50 $466,428.00 $523,564.75

BIDDERS PROPOSAL (AS READ) $447,249.50 $448,610.00 $454,905.50 $466,428.00 $534,184.75
did not use addendum 2-2

for proposal

Whiteline Construction, 

Inc.

Schroeder & 

Schroeder

Strada Construction 

Company

Davis Concrete 

Construction Co. 

J&J Newell Concrete 

Contractors, Inc.


