
Domestic Supplies Bid Results 1/7/2011

Paper Products
Price 
per 

UOM Manufacturer

Price 
per 

UOM Manufacturer
Price 

per UOM Manufacturer

Price 
per 

UOM Manufacturer

Price 
per 

UOM Manufacturer
Toilet Tissue 2-ply, 500 sheet, 4.5 x 3.75, 
96/cs case

$40.45/ 
$32.68 Renown/          Appeal $35.69 Atlas 31.18 Vondrehle

GP-19375 Compact Coreless Toilet Tissue 1 case no bid $42.92 G.P. $66.76 GP
9” Bathroom Tissue 2 ply, 1000 ft each, 
12/cs case

$28.25/ 
$20.11 Renown/          Appeal $24.24 Atlas $22.59 Vondrehle

Toilet Tissue 2-ply 96RL Green Seal case $41.38 Renown $33.13 Atlas $31.10 Vondrehle
Double Soft Bath Tissue 2ply 80/cs case no bid $38.28 G.P. $47.06 Bay West
GP- 89460 EnMotion Roll Towel 800', 6/cs 
(62 Dispensers Must Be Provided at No 
Charge) case no bid $47.72 G.P. $35.73 Vondrehle
Roll Towel, perforated, 90 sheets, 2-ply, 11 x 
9" sheet,  30/cs case $21.06 Renown $22.62 Boardwalk 20.47 Vondrehle
Facial Tissue,  24/216 case no bid $51.54 CPC $53.56 P & G
Facial Tissue,  100/Bx, 30 Bx/Cs. case $25.23 Bay West $15.18 Boardwalk $13.73 Boardwalk
Seat Cover 1/2 fold, 20/250 case $30.19 Renown $31.90 Krystal $31.29 Krystal
Seat Cover 1/2 fold, 24/125 Scott Kimberly 
Clark case $83.76 K. Clark $83.74 Scott $79.33 Kimberly Clark
Tampax Tampons 500/cs case $59.19 Hosp. Spec. $62.23 Tampax $56.57 Hospeco
Maxithins #4 San Nap, 250/cs case $25.80 Hosp. Spec. $34.12 MT-4 $35.62 Hospeco

Rubbermaid Waxed Bags 250/cs case
21.44/ 
16.05

Rubbermaid/      
Hosp. Spec $19.70 Rubbermaid $19.67 Hospeco

Cleaners & Chemicals

Do-It-All Germicidal Foam Cleaner 20 oz. 
aerosol, 12/cs case no bid $35.67 Dymon $45.65

Ecolab 
Asepticare 12-
14oz. $21.76 Chase germicidal Cleaner

Purell Hand Sanitizer 1000 ML NXT for wall 
dispenser, 8 ct #2156-08 case $68.90 Gojo $68.35 Gojo $61.80 Ecolab Endure $66.73 Gojo
Purell Hand Sanitizer 2 liter pump (for FLC & 
CAC), 4 ct #9625-04 case $81.76 Gojo $77.80 Gojo $75.81 Gojo

Gojo-9112-12 Lotion Skin Cleaner 800 ML, 
BIB, 12/cs restroom soap case $39.99 Gojo $38.84 Gojo $49.10

Ecolab Epicare 
950 ML $36.89 Gojo

Kimcare Antibacterial Soap, gal, 4/cs case $37.98 K. Clark $32.47 KCC $78.46

Ecolab AB 
Clean N 
Smooth $29.00

Dermabrand antibacterial 
soap

Misty Moisturizing Skin Cleanser, gallon, 
4/cs case no bid $32.98 AMR $49.98

Ecolab Clean 
N Smooth $29.44 Amrep

Ecolab, Inc Expert Chemical & Supply Inc.AMSAM All American Poly Aztek Supply Corp
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Ecolab, Inc Expert Chemical & Supply Inc.AMSAM All American Poly Aztek Supply Corp

Dial Pure & Natural Soap, gallon 4/cs case no bid discontinued $33.42 Dial

Soft & Silky Pink Lotion 800ml 12/pk case no bid $43.16 Gojo $21.08 Dermabrand pink lotion soap
Hand & Body Lotion 1000 ml pump bottle, 
8/cs,  Kutol 66236 case no bid no bid $51.89 Kutol

BASICS Liquid Hand Soap Pump 12/16oz case no bid $25.32 Dial $27.15 Dial

Lemon Quat Disinfectant Cleanser, gallon 
4/cs case $28.15 Renown $40.43 Buckeye $110.00

Ecolab 
Disinfectant 
Cleaner $37.93 Nyco

HDQC2 COG Neutral Disinfectant 4/2L case no bid no bid $42.10

Ecolab Neutral 
Disinfectant 
CLNR 2-1.3L $31.63 spartan

Palmolive Dishwashing Liquid, 25 oz., 12/cs case $39..51 P & G $39.10 CPC $45.81

Ecolab 
Pantastic 9 
32oz $38.82 Palmolive

Lysol Disinfectant Wipes 35 canister, 12 ct case $33.81 Clorox $30.91 REC $89.00
Ecolab 
Aseptiwipe $31.75 Reckett Benkiser

Clorox Bleach 96 oz, 6/cs case $16.38 Clorox $12.16 Clorox $7.15 Majestic bleach

Windex 32 oz trigger bottle, 12/cs case $53.16 Johnson $49.67 DRK $27.80
Ecolab Glass 
Force 6 32oz $50.98 Drackett

Time Mist Air Fresh refill, 12/cs case $30.80 IBI $54.16 TMS $33.32 Air fresh refill

Urinal Screen with Block, 12/bx box $18.80 Renown $12.83 Krystal $27.50
Ecolab Aim 
Encounter $11.88 Innovative

Comet Cleanser 21 oz., 24/cs case $15.81 P & G $29.88 PGC $78.22
Ecolab Magic 
Scrub 16 24oz $29.94 P & G

Bowl Thickened 9% Acid Bowl Cleaner 24 
oz, 12/cs case $14.82 Renown no bid $50.54

Ecolab 
Clinging Bowl 
Cleaner 12 
32oz $18.59 Crown 9% thick bowl cleaner 

Simple Green 13005, gallon, 6/cs case $39.85 Simple Green $65.03 Simple Green $49.90

Ecolab quik fill 
degreaser 2.5 
gal $59.26 Simple Green

Food Service
Foam Cup 8 oz., 1000/cs case $15.91 Dart $14.70 DCC $14.00 Dart
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Ecolab, Inc Expert Chemical & Supply Inc.AMSAM All American Poly Aztek Supply Corp

Foam Cup 12 oz., 1000/cs case $25.84 Dart $20.69 DCC $20.39 Dart
8 oz. Paper Hot Cups, 1000/cs case $54.32 Solo $39.78 SPH $44.89 Spring Grove
Plastic Plates 10.25", 500/cs case no bid $40.01 CHN $35.79 Dart
Paper Plate 9" white, 200/cs case no bid $15.45 AJM $15.69 AJM
Paper Plate 6" white, 1000/cs case no bid $10.30 AJM $10.47 AJM
Foam Plate 9" white, 500/cs case no bid $15.98 THI $18.64 Darnell
Foam Bowl 12 oz., white, 1000/cs case no bid $19.94 DCC $18.47 Darnell
Plastic Knife, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs case no bid $22.81 DIX $42.48 Darnell
Plastic Fork, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs case no bid $22.81 DIX $42.48 Darnell
Plastic Spoon, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs case no bid $22.81 DIX $42.48 Darnell

Dinner Napkin 2-ply, 15 x 27, 100/pk, 30/cs case no bid $33.72 Boardwalk $38.96 Spring Grove
Liners

Liner, 24 x 32  .5 mil., black, 500/cs case $17.53 Renown $23.01 $17.62 Aargus $15.33 Jaguar
Liner, 33 x 39  1.1 mil, black, 250/cs case $24.11 Renown $20.03 $19.87 Aargus $12.85 Jaguar
Liner, 38 x 58 1.5 mil,  black, 100/cs case $21.53 Renown $13.34 $17.45 Aargus $21.75 Biostar
Liner, 38 x 58  2 mil, black, 100/cs case $28.73 Renown $17.16 $22.10 Aargus $21.85 Jaguar
Liner, 40 x 46  1.7 mil black, 100/cs case $24.04 Renown $12.73 $19.85 Aargus $16.94 Biostar

Miscellaneous
Wet Mop, #24 cotton reg., 12/cs case $56.61 Renown $28.60 ABCO $24.90 Zephyr
Latex Gloves, powder free, LG & XL, 10 
bx/cs case $52.11 Renown $45.57 Custom $45.31 Safety Zone
Key
No product bid
Substitute product bid
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Domestic Supplies Bid Results 1/7/2011

Paper Products

Toilet Tissue 2-ply, 500 sheet, 4.5 x 3.75, 
96/cs 
GP-19375 Compact Coreless Toilet Tissue 1
9” Bathroom Tissue 2 ply, 1000 ft each, 
12/cs
Toilet Tissue 2-ply 96RL Green Seal
Double Soft Bath Tissue 2ply 80/cs
GP- 89460 EnMotion Roll Towel 800', 6/cs 
(62 Dispensers Must Be Provided at No 
Charge)
Roll Towel, perforated, 90 sheets, 2-ply, 11 x 
9" sheet,  30/cs
Facial Tissue,  24/216
Facial Tissue,  100/Bx, 30 Bx/Cs.
Seat Cover 1/2 fold, 20/250
Seat Cover 1/2 fold, 24/125 Scott Kimberly 
Clark
Tampax Tampons 500/cs
Maxithins #4 San Nap, 250/cs

Rubbermaid Waxed Bags 250/cs
Cleaners & Chemicals

Do-It-All Germicidal Foam Cleaner 20 oz. 
aerosol, 12/cs
Purell Hand Sanitizer 1000 ML NXT for wall 
dispenser, 8 ct #2156-08
Purell Hand Sanitizer 2 liter pump (for FLC & 
CAC), 4 ct #9625-04

Gojo-9112-12 Lotion Skin Cleaner 800 ML, 
BIB, 12/cs restroom soap

Kimcare Antibacterial Soap, gal, 4/cs 
Misty Moisturizing Skin Cleanser, gallon, 
4/cs

Tri- K Supplies

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

$47.50 Windsoft $33.90 NTC $35.25 SCA $35.41 Bay West $43.05 Windsoft
$66.75 GP $44.90 GP $42.05 GP $48.10 GP $54.53 GP

$35.85 Windsoft $23.60 Bay West $25.00 SCA $24.30 BW $31.45 Windsoft
$42.25 Boardwalk $41.90 Bay West $37.15 APM $45.41 GP $43.05 Kruger
$60.90 GP $48.90 Bay West no bid $58.40 BW $43.05 Kruger

$43.00

Baywest roll 
towel 
dispenser $52.90 GP no bid $51.30 GP $58.75 GP

$26.20 Boardwalk $22.30 Bay West no bid $20.40 Stefco $26.02 Windsoft
$53.56 Puffs $39.90 Bay West no bid $58.90 KCC $55.95 PG
$14.60 Boardwalk $18.90 NTC $17.40 SCA $16.06 BWK $16.85 Marcal
$33.25 Krystal $31.50 Hospecs $38.45 Hospecs $16.70 Kry $35.95 Rochmid

$89.25 Kimberly Clark $89.30 Kimberly Clark no bid $82.40 KCC $82.05 KC
$58.60 Tampax $59.60 Tampax $60.45 Hospecs $57.40 Hos $58.95 Rochmid
$35.70 Hos $31.50 Maxithins no bid $33.40 Hos $37.50 Rochmid

$20.90 $14.00 Rubbermaid $21.65 Rubbermaid $11.90 Hos $18.50 Rochmid

$32.50 DYM $31.90 Dymon no bid $29.80 Sys $38.15 Dymon

$69.00 $66.30 Purell $65.95 Gojo $56.30 Gojo $70.95 Gojo

$78.40 $75.50 Purell $75.00 Gojo $64.01 Gojo $83.80 Gojo

$39.05 $36.90 Gojo $37.35 Gojo $37.40 Gojo $43.45 Gojo

$29.00 Dermabrand $44.90 Kimcare $36.65 Kimberly Clark $37.40 KCC $37.35 KC

$31.15 AMR $34.10 Misty no bid $28.30 AMR $35.65 Amron

Warehouse Direct Inc.
Facility Supply Systems 
Inc.

Interboro Packaging 
Corp. PCS Industries The Standard Companies
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Domestic Supplies Bid Results 1/7/2011

Paper Products

T il t Ti 2 l 500 h t 4 5 3 75Dial Pure & Natural Soap, gallon 4/cs

Soft & Silky Pink Lotion 800ml 12/pk
Hand & Body Lotion 1000 ml pump bottle, 
8/cs,  Kutol 66236

BASICS Liquid Hand Soap Pump 12/16oz

Lemon Quat Disinfectant Cleanser, gallon 
4/cs

HDQC2 COG Neutral Disinfectant 4/2L

Palmolive Dishwashing Liquid, 25 oz., 12/cs

Lysol Disinfectant Wipes 35 canister, 12 ct
Clorox Bleach 96 oz, 6/cs

Windex 32 oz trigger bottle, 12/cs
Time Mist Air Fresh refill, 12/cs

Urinal Screen with Block, 12/bx

Comet Cleanser 21 oz., 24/cs 

Bowl Thickened 9% Acid Bowl Cleaner 24 
oz, 12/cs

Simple Green 13005, gallon, 6/cs 
Food Service

Foam Cup 8 oz., 1000/cs

Tri- K Supplies

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Warehouse Direct Inc.
Facility Supply Systems 
Inc.

Interboro Packaging 
Corp. PCS Industries The Standard Companies

$35.40 Dial $34.90 Dial no bid $33.60 Dial $35.85 Dial

$22.00 Dermabrand $26.50 Kutol no bid $29.40 Dial $19.99 DOR

$55.00 Whisk $41.50 Kutol no bid $48.30 Kutol $69.00 Kutol

$25.10 Dial $36.90 Dial no bid $26.40 Dial $24.98 Dial

$78.50 Lysol $29.50 Proline $18.95 Crown $30.60 Can $35.45 Amrep

$31.00 Misty $54.00 Spartan no bid $46.70 Spar $99.99 Rochmid

$36.70 $37.50 Palmolive no bid $38.40 Palmolive $37.20 Palmolive

$31.00 $31.90 Lysol $33.75 Reckitt $31.00 Lysol $39.99 Rockitt
$12.70 $11.80 Clorox $12.49 Clorox $10.00 Kirk $14.20 Clorox

$49.90 $51.90 Windex $51.10 Diversey $46.70 Wind $56.95 Johnson 
$36.70 $47.50 Time Mist no bid $54.00 Time Mist $47.00 Rubbermaid

$19.25 $13.90 Fresh $13.25 Krystal $16.70 Fresh $16.85 Krystal

$30.70 $29.80 Comet $33.50 P & G $32.00 Comet $31.55 P & G

$34.70 $16.90 Proline $19.35 Nyco $16.40 Crown $23.55 Rochmid

$62.75 $62.50 Simple Green $70.65 Simple Green $58.00 Simple Green $61.05 Simple Green

$16.73 Dart $14.80 Dart $16.65 Dart $14.00 Dart $15.39 Dart
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Domestic Supplies Bid Results 1/7/2011

Paper Products

T il t Ti 2 l 500 h t 4 5 3 75Foam Cup 12 oz., 1000/cs
8 oz. Paper Hot Cups, 1000/cs
Plastic Plates 10.25", 500/cs
Paper Plate 9" white, 200/cs
Paper Plate 6" white, 1000/cs
Foam Plate 9" white, 500/cs 
Foam Bowl 12 oz., white, 1000/cs
Plastic Knife, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs
Plastic Fork, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs
Plastic Spoon, white heavyweight 100/bx, 
10/cs

Dinner Napkin 2-ply, 15 x 27, 100/pk, 30/cs
Liners

Liner, 24 x 32  .5 mil., black, 500/cs
Liner, 33 x 39  1.1 mil, black, 250/cs
Liner, 38 x 58 1.5 mil,  black, 100/cs
Liner, 38 x 58  2 mil, black, 100/cs
Liner, 40 x 46  1.7 mil black, 100/cs

Miscellaneous
Wet Mop, #24 cotton reg., 12/cs
Latex Gloves, powder free, LG & XL, 10 
bx/cs
Key
No product bid
Substitute product bid

Tri- K Supplies

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Price per 
UOM Manufacturer

Warehouse Direct Inc.
Facility Supply Systems 
Inc.

Interboro Packaging 
Corp. PCS Industries The Standard Companies

$23.60 Dart $21.50 Dart $23.55 Dart $20.00 Dart $21.85 Dart
$51.20 Boardwalk $51.50 Boardwalk $54.95 Boardwalk $73.60 Dart $57.85 Boardwalk
$38.10 Dart $34.50 Dart $57.98 Marcal $67.40 Dart $66.70 Boardwalk
$17.30 AJM $19.80 Gen Pak $17.75 AJM $20.40 Dart $21.00 Fountain
$11.60 AJM $11.70 Gen Pak $12.55 AJM $12.60 Dart $12.75 Fountain
$25.60 Boardwalk $17.90 Pactiv $25.50 Boardwalk $14.60 Dart $18.00 Dart
$30.30 Boardwalk $17.50 Dart $43.50 Dart $29.70 Dart $22.40 Dart

$60.60 Solo $18.60 Fremont $27.90 Dixie $60.60 Dart $24.20 GP

$60.60 Solo $18.60 Fremont $27.90 Dixie $60.60 Dart $24.20 GP

$60.60 Solo $18.60 Fremont $27.90 Dixie $60.60 Dart $24.20 GP

$43.40 Marcal $36.90 Advance Mills no bid $34.80 Boardwalk $42.24 GP

$16.30 Jaguar $8.98 $13.90 Proline $13.70 Colonial $13.00 Jaguar $13.79 Colonial
$13.65 Jaguar $10.72 $20.50 Proline $23.95 Colonial $21.30 Jaguar $26.05 Colonial
$23.50 Jaguar $10.84 $18.70 Proline $19.90 Colonial $18.05 Jaguar $21.80 Colonial
$25.20 Jaguar $11.82 $23.50 Proline $24.45 Colonial $23.04 Jaguar $28.75 Colonial
$19.40 Jaguar $10.32 $18.90 Proline $19.95 Colonial $19.00 Jaguar $21.10 Colonial

$28.70 Odell $32.50 Proline $39.50 ? $32.10 Uns $5.50 Unisan mop

$7.47 Ansell $50.00 $45.90 Safety Zone $71.05 Misc $36.00 Safety Zone $49.00 Safety Zone
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