
Village of Orland Park Recreation Parks Department

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 9

Speedo Female 

Lifeguard Suit 

Solid Flyback – 

polyster blend

(Navy w/guard logo)

Speedo Lifeguard 

Zuma Trunk

Orange

Female Board 

Short 

Navy

Hip Pack

 ( 2 pocket w/Guard 

logo)

Fox 40 

Mini Whistle

Break-away 

Lanyards

Seal Easy Kit 

w/valve

Cut-A-

Way 

Rescue 

Tube 

Dive 

Rings sets

Kieffer Swim Shop*** $42.50 $23.00*** $18.75 $5.25 $2.50 $1.50 $7.95 $38.00 $4.95

The Lifeguard Store* $34.50 $24.00 $10.00 $4.75 $2.40 $1.50 $6.50 $29.75 $5.35

Recreonics $38.34 $25.46 $17.49 $5.57 $4.23 $2.23 $8.33 $48.83 $6.17

Water Safety Products** no bid no bid no bid $4.50 $2.35 $1.65 $6.75 $42.00 no bid

Comparision of item pricing received for Pool clothing/Equipment RFP

* + Shipping charge of $80  **+Shipping charge of $165  ***only limited sizes available

shared:cpac:correspondance:rfp clothing equipment summary



Village of Orland Park Recreation Parks Department

 

 @ Quantity

 to be ordered

Price Total Price Price Total Price Price Total Price

Speedo Female 

Lifeguard Suit

Solid Fylyback poly 

blend 

Navy w/guard logo 150 $34.50 $5,175.00

Speedo Lifeguard 

Zuma Trunk

Orange 50 $23.00 $1,150.00

Female Board Short 

Navy 60 $10.00 $600.00

Hip Pack

 ( 2 pocket w/Guard 

logo) 250 $4.50 $1,125.00

Fox 40 

Mini Whistle 300 $2.35 $705.00

Break-away Lanyards 300 $1.50

Seal Easy Kit w/valve 90  $6.75 $607.50

Cut-A-Way Rescue 

Tube 15 $29.75
Dive Rings sets 20 $4.95 $99.00

$5,775.00 $1,249.00 $2,437.50

Shipping $80.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total $5,855.00 $1,249.00 $2,437.50
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Total Price for items

The Lifeguard Store Kieffer Swim Shop Water Safety Products
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