ITB 19-009 Comparison

LOCATION DESCRIPTION
3 Tennis Courts;
Cachey Park pickleball striping
Remove & Install New
Cachey Park Fencing Fencing & Gates

1 Tennis Court (RCC);
Fence Repair, Tennis
Posts; add Pickleball

Brentwood Park Striping
TOTAL
Unit Pricing
New Douglas DTP-37 tennis net posts in existing sleeves
New Douglas TN-30 tennis nets w/center strap
New Douglas DTP-37 tennis net posts for pickleball includes footings

New Douglas TN-30 tennis nets w/center strap for
pickleball

Repair or replace any missing or damaged fence rails,
fencing, fence ties, gates or gate hardware on a time and

material basis. perhour + Materials

___Cost
US Tennis Evans & Son BSN Sports
$92,630.00 $80,000.00 no bid
$26,300.00 $32,000.00 no bid
$11,380.00 $14,000.00 no bid
$130,310.00 $126,000.00 n/a
Cost per Unit
$425.00 $500.00 $166.22 *
$240.00 $300.00 $110.93 *
$2,250.00 $2,500.00 $166.22 *
$230.00 $260.00 $110.93*
$150.00 $150.00 no bid

* Altn Item



